From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, March 14, 2016 3:19 PM
To: Ann Rodriquez

Subject: Re: LSJ Dock: Pokey

Yes

On Monday, 14 March 2016, Ann Rodriquez - wrote:

Hey Bossman,

Per our conversation...
-15 it ok for me to pay Pokey $500.00 from his 510k bid?
-Is it ok for me to also pay his helper 5120 a day?
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