
From: Valeria Chomsky 
Sent: Monday, April 16, 2018 11:43 AM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Cc: Noam Chomsky 
Subject: Fwd: taxes 

Are these payments that=Deborah mentioned, referring to 2017? 

We haven'= received the transaction statements to this date. 
<=div> 

 Forwarded message 
F=om: Deborah Pechet Quinan 
Date: Th=, Dec 28, 2017 at 2:50 PM 
Subject: RE: taxes 
To: Noam Chomsk 
Cc: Ric=ard Kahn 

<mailto 

Dear Noam,<=span> 

>, Valeria Chomsky 

Max advised me that the M=ss estimate in the amount of $30,000 per the CPA's recommendation =as been paid from 
the trust. He advised me that the federal estimate of $150,000 per Richard's instruction was paid a couple of weeks 
a=o. He made the payments based on the vouchers. I will ask him =o provide a transaction statement from the trust for 
your records and will=forward that along. 

Best, 

Deborah 

 =C2 
Deborah Pechet Quinan, Esq. LL.M. 
Shareholder 
Chair, Trusts & Estates Group<=pan style="font-size:10.5ptfont-family:"Calibri","sans-s=rif";color:black"> 
255 State Street,=7th Floor 
<https://maps.google.com/?q=255+State+Street,+7th+Floor%C2%A0%7=%C2V0A0Boston,+MA+02109&entry=gmail&sou 
rce=g> I 
<https://ma.s.google.com/?q=255+State+Street,+7th+Floor%C2%A0%7CVOC2%A0Boston,+MA+021=9&entry=gmail&sou 
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rce=g> =C2 Boston, MA =2109 
<https://maps.google.com/?q=255+State+Street,+7th+Floor%C=%A0%7C%C2%A0Boston,+MA+02109&entry=gmail&sou 
rce=g> 
Direct 
Office 

Cell ssistant - Jayne Mahoney 
Fax: 

e-mail <mailto ./span> I =C2 www.riw.com <http://www.riw.com/> = B=O 
<http://www.riw.comiatto=ney/deborah-pechet-quinank 
=1span> 

From: Noam Cho=sky (mailto mailto 
Sent: Thursday, December 28, 2017 1:11 PM 
To: Deborah Pechet Quinan 
Cc: Richard Kahn; Valeria Chomsky 
Subject: taxes 

I would like to know whether our federal and state t=xes have been paid, and if so, to have the receipts. 

Noam 

NOTICE: This email with its attachments, if any, is intended solely for per=itted use by authorized recipients. If you are 
not an authorized recipient=of this email, your retention, transmission, disclosure, or use of this em=il is prohibited. If 
you received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete this email and it= attachments from your devices 
and systems. 
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