
From: Karp, Brad S 
Sent: Friday, March 4, 2016 12:49 AM 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com* 
Subject: Re: Fw: Leon 

Of course. But I'll escalate any way. 

Brad S. Karp Partner 
Paul, Weiss, Rifkind, Wharton & Garrison LLP 
1285 Avenue of the Americas New York, NY 10019-6064 

I (212) 492-0316 (Direct Fax) 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.comj 
Sent: Thursday, March 03, 2016 07:42 PM 
To: Karp, Brad S 
Subject: Re: Fw: Leon 

I will pursue alternate 

I www.paulweiss.com 

On Thursday, 3 March 2016, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Understood 

On Thursday, March 3, 2016 Kar Brad S 
<javascript:_e(%7B%7D,'cvml' > wrote: 

Jeffrey, 

I need to escalate this, because of our firm policies on escrow funds. 

Let me do so tomorrow. 

Brad 

Brad S. Karp Partner 
Paul, Weiss, Rifkind, Wharton & Garrison LIP 
1285 Avenue of the Americas I New York, NY 10019-6064 

(212) 492.0316 (Direct Fax) 
www.paulweiss.com <http://www.paulweiss.com> 
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From: Birenboim, Bruce 
Sent: Thursday, March 03, 2016 07:12 PM 
To: Karp, Brad S 
Cc: Reisner, Lorin L 
Subject: RE: Leon 

Our policy is not to act as escrow agent, except in standard personal real estate transactions. 

Bruce Birenboim I Partner 
Paul, Weiss, Rifkind, Wharton & Garrison LIP 
1285 Avenue of the Americas j New York, NY 10019-6064 

I (212) 492-0165 (Direct Fax) 
I www.paulweiss.com <http://www.paulweiss.com> 

From: Karp, Brad S 
Sent: Thursday, March 3, 2016 7:06:57 PM 
To: Birenboim, Bruce 
Cc: Reisner, Lorin L 
Subject: Leon 

I've been asked by Leon if we can have a $2m escrow fund established at the firm, from which payments 
would be made monthly pursuant to a contract with an individual. Leon would pay any and all costs and indemnify the 
firm against any claims. 

Is this something we do? 

Brad S. Karp I Partner 
Paul, Weiss, Rifkind, Wharton & Garrison LLP 
1285 Avenue of the Americas I New York, NY 10019-6064 

I (212) 492-0316 (Direct Fax) 

I www.paulweiss.com <http://www.paulweiss.com> 

This message is intended only for the use of the Addressee and may contain information that is 
privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination of this 
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please erase all copies of the 
message and its attachments and notify us immediately. 
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please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <javascript:_e(%78%7D,Icvmlijeevacation@gmail.comi);> 

, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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