From: Brad Wechsler <BWechsler@imax.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 2, 2016 4:02 PM
To: 'jeevacation@gmail.com’; _
Subject: Re:

Jeffrey-we have paul weiss actuarial doing "estate flow" and akin doing "death implications"” in brh, tra, bfp. Both have
promised drafts today and completed work product by end of week. I'll have a better idea by end of day today but, for
now, still assume 3/8 works. | will call u shortly. B

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, March 02, 2016 10:08 AM

To: Brad Wechsler; Melanie Spinella <_::-
Subject:

where are we with fire drill. report. ?  will it be ready this week? |need to know today no problem if it takes more
time, but we will need to reschedule a meeting to review.

please note

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

wWwWw.imax,com
IMAX® is a registered trademark of IMAX Corporation.
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Information contained in this e-mail correspondence and any attachments is confidential information intended only for
the use of the individual or entity named above.

Any reader of this message who is not the intended recipient of this correspondence is hereby notified that any
dissemination, distribution, copying or communication of the contents of this correspondence is strictly prohibited. If
this e-mail was not addressed to you , please immediately notify us by phone in Canada at (905) 403-6500 (collect calls
will be accepted) or by email at webmaster@imax.com and delete and destroy this correspondence inadvertently sent
to you. Thank you
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