
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, February 16, 2016 11:49 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Ambulance hold or no? 

Hold 

On Tuesday, 16 February 2016, Richard Kahn &=t; 
wrote: 

Shall we=proceed with ambulance or hold. Please advise. Thank you. 

Sen= from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Steve Apgar 
Date: February 16, 2016 at 5:57=20 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn 

<javascript:_e(%7B%7D,84=39;cvmr, 
Subject: Ambulance hold or no? 

mailto: &g=; 

Richard the gu=s have started on this truck getting it ready but I have not seen the wire=and it has been 
a week, can you confirm we still should proceed. ? 

Steve Apgar 
1-503-720-4067 
www.apgarambulance.com <http://www. Q=91 

days. 

On Feb 12, 2016, at 8:03 AM, Steve Apgar wrote: 

Richard, 

I let the g=ys in Bakersfield know to place and hold this unit and that I expected thi= to close. 

Upon wire ...I will begin ordering of =11 new duplicate on board Medical items should be shipped in 5-6 

schedule graphics "ZORRO EMERGENCY" 
Final check through off batteries and all remaining inventory. 
Estimate delivery dates. 

Thanks ,Q=A0 
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Steve Ap ar 

On Feb 10, 2016, at 6:34 PM, Richard=Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com 
<javascript:_e(%7B%7D;cvmr/richardkahnl2=gmail.com1;» wrote:=br> 

Intention was not to drop=anything and have price reduced 
Lets do 50,000 even and leave ev=rything in quote 
If acceptable I will wire 50% deposit tom=rrow 

Also would like to name this ambulance: 40=A0Zorro Emergency 

Thank you 

<=iv> 

From: Steve Apgar 
<javascript:_e(%7B%7D/cvm& > 

Date: Wednesday,=February 10, 2016 at 6:44 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 

<javascript:_e(%7B%7D;cvmr; -> &=t; 
Subject: Re: Did you get th=s. 

Only if I delete so=ething how about no EMT delivery to Stanley and we just meet your 
property=manager in BAKERSFIELD ? This is mostly about supply and dem=nd and a 22,000 mile truck is usually 
$45,000 in Bakersfield. Do you=want to drop the delivery cost of $3800 and just send a representative out=to pick it up? 

Steve Apgar 

On Feb 10 2016 at 4:27 PM =ichard Kahn 
<javascript:_e(%7B%7D;cvmr, >=wrote: 

i did and thank you 
can you work with me a bit 
can we do for 49,000? 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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On Feb 10, 2016, at 4:08 PM, +APGAR+ <=a 
href="javascript:_e(%78%7D/cvmUapgar@wyoming.coml=" target="_blank">apgar@wyoming.com> wrote: 

<=>Did you get t=e measurements 
<=pan style="font-size:l0pt;font-family:Arial,sans-serif"> 

23 feet total lengt= 
105 Inched wide at mirrors fol=ed out 
107 Inches max height at=rear 

10 foot door minimum with 12 foot being better 
Q=A0 Steve Apgar 

+ APGAR AMBULANCE +<=u> 

<javascript:_e(%7B%7D/cvmr,' 

<http://=ww.apgarambulance.com> 
http://www.facebook.com/apgarambulance=/span> 

<HBRICorrolInvoice.docx> 
=/blockquote> 

=please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
=onfidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside i=formation, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the=property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
c=mmunication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlaw=ul. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacati=n@gmail.com> , and 
destroy t=is communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. cop=right -all rights reserved 
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