From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 10, 2016 7:08 PM

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Series 9 Funding

Yes

On Wednesday, 10 February 2016, Richard Kahn _mailt_
wr=te: '

=5 this ok for DKl to authorize release of our funds
please advise
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

<=jy style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">From: Andrew
unzsavd;mscrim:_e{%m%m;wm-;_

Subject:

=b>Date: February 10, 2016 at 1:52:28 PM EST

=/div=

To: Richa=d Kahn <
<javascript:_e(%7B%7D,'cvml’

<=spanz

Rich,
| am writing to confirm tha= the $125,000,000 Series 9 investment was funded into Jawbone's accoun=
with no restrictions on the use of funds.

Thanks=
Andrew
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please note

T=e information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be a=torney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is int=nded only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

communication or any pa=t thereof is strictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have recei=ed this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by

retu=n e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and
destroy this communication an= all copies thereof,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights r=served
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