
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, February 12, 2016 5:34 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Paris AC EPSTEIN / CLIMATIS (quote for system improvement and repair) 

pay it 

On Fri, Feb 12, 2016 at 12:13 PM, Richard Kah
wrote: 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin =orwarded message: 

From:=bellakleiri  > 
Date: February 12, 2016 at 11:05:57 AM =ST 
To: Richard Kahr > 
Subject: =wd: Paris AC EPSTEIN / CLIMATIS (quote for system improvement and re=air) 

The last proposal attached. We need to approve or reject th= attached proposal. Please advise 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

c=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">From: 

Subj=ct: Fwd: Paris AC EPSTEIN / CLIMATIS (quote for sy=tem improvement and repair) 

Date: February 4, 2016 at 11:16:04 AM EST=br> 
To: Richard Kahn  
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Climatis quote for A/C repair - 11,950.80 =uros. Proposal and MJ translation attached. 

=div style="word-wrap:break-word"> 

Thank you,Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=' ="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-
left:=px">From: bellaklein g=; 

Subject: Re: EPSTEIN / CLIMATIS (quote for system improvement and repair) 

Date: Februar= 1, 2016 at 11:25:28 AM EST 

To= Marie.' Experto 
<mailto:  >= 

EMI 
On Feb 1, 2016, at 11:13 AM, Marie-=oseph Experton 

> wrote:

=div style="font-style:normal;font-variant:normal;font-weight:normal;lett=r-
spacing:normal ;Iine-height:normal;text-align:start;text-indent:0px;text-=ransform :none;white-space:normal ;word-
spacing:0px;font-size:12pt;backgroun=-color:rgb(255,255,255);font-family:limes New Roman',Times,serif"= 

Draft English sum=ary of CLIMATIS quote dated January 9th, 2016, for=system 
improvement and repair: 
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verification of the air conditioning machines (total of 34).=A0installed 
in the apartment manufactured by CARRIER:4,680.00 € VAT exclud=d, 

repair of the air conditionin= system No.2: =,299.00 € VAT excluded, 
verification and repair (including small materials= proposed in the 

report dated December 21st, 2015: 1,490.00 €VAT excluded,=/div> 
* 

excluded, 

<mail 

climatisation.<=div> 

repair to improve water flo= when inadequate: 1,490.00 € VAT 

* 

total of 9,959.00 € + VAT 20% =3D 11,=50.80 € 

Best regards. 

M=rie-Joseph Experton 
Avocat au Barreau de Paris 4,=A9tabli a Bruxelles 
avenue Louise 65 b=ite 11 
1050 Bruxelles 
Bel ' 
Tel. 
Fax 

GSM 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/span>valdson cotri 

Subject: 

=span>Date: January 11, 2016 at 3:14:=7 AM EST 

To: =A0Bella Klein 

-bonjour mme. 
voici le devis dde=la societe climatis pour le fonctionnement de la 

cordialement. 
valdson. 

 Forwarded message 
From: Climatis 
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Date: 2016.01-10 20:32 GMT+01:00 
Subject: Devi= n° DC2771 - 
To: valdson cotri 
Cc: Cyrielle DUM 

<mailto 

Bonjour, 

Pour faire suite a notre audit, veuillez trouver ci=joint le devis pour les travaux 
du 22 rue Foch a Paris.=/div> 

<=div> 
En vous souhaitant bon=e reception. 

Cordi=lement<=> 
<=pan style="font-size:lOptfont-family:Arial,sans-serif"> qu> 
CLIMATIS=u> 
Mr MASURE Christop=e=/u> 
18-22 Rue d L=;Arras 
92000 Nan=erre=u> 
Tel : 
Fa-

</=iv> 
<DevisCLIMATISreparationlanvier16.pdf> 

<=div> 

=/blockquote> 

please =ote 

The information contained in this communication is 
confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside informati=n, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the propert= of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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and may be unlawful. If =ou have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com> , and 
destroy this comm=nication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -=11 rights reserved 
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