
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Wednesda , January 27, 2016 12:24 AM 

Re: 

have not beeen able to get gloria , im open to any s=ggesitons 

On Tue, Jan 26, 2016 at 7:21 PM wrote: 

Is there a memorial for him? Should I help put something together?=C2. Have you spoken with Gloria? 

Fire at my apt=bldg this morning. My apt was slammed with smoke damage. Deja vu. =ust managing thru 
this time. Still hoping to go to NC Thursday and c=uld hop up to Boston from there, weather permitting. 

may 

<=div> 
Xoxo 

Co-authored with iPhone auto-correctadiv> 

On Jan 26, 2016, at 3:22 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wro=e: 

if you or =nyone wants a minksy memorial service I will pay 
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The information contained in this communication isar>confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, 
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the use of the addressee. It is =he property of 
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=C24> please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error =please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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