From: Richard kahn [ R

Sent: Thursday, April 12, 2018 7:50 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Fwd: updates - Russell

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: =/b>Re: =pdates

Date: =/b>April 12, 2018 at 3:36:09 PM =DT

1) rimco refund still fighting nothing back someone from my =ffice going to PR on Monday and will be going to
their office

2)1 have pricing we are leveling and will have to you guys =omorrow (| Gave this info to Jeffrey yesterday)

3)we=have received pricing as indicated in #2 we are being told 6 weeks =otal of time needed

4) no need for dob =iling we may want to consider it for the spa work when that comes =p

Russell =ernandez

On Apr 12, =018, at 3:27 PM, Richard Kahn _wrute:

can you please provide updates on the =ollowing:
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1) Rimco =efund - is this going to happen or shall we protest charge? if so what =mount will be
refunded?

2) 71st - do you have a =ime frame and price for scaffolding for entry hall and master =ath

3) 71st - bids that we can review and time =rame to begin?

4) 71st - will we require DOB =ilings?

please =dvise
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

On Apr 6, 2018, at 3:37 PM, Richard Kah_ wrote:

any =pdates?
please advise
thank =ou

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

On Apr 2, 2018, at 7:44 PM, Richard Kahn _rnte:

ok when shall =e receive credit card refund and please advise on amount
thank you

Richard Kahn
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HBREK =ssociates Inc.

On Apr 2, 2018, at 6:41 PM, Russell Hernandez

They don't see it as a =avor they see it as work that was done the argument |
making is they =harge just for three days when they only work for two days
| have a relationship with Catapillar

Russell Hernandez

On Apr 2, 2018, at 5:24 PM, Richard Kah_
I -

Rimco doing us a favor to give us something =ack when they required us to
prepay 9 days and we only used 4...thought this was your close relationship and yet you are =ecommending that we may
have to protest credit card charge..

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

On Mar 28, 2018, at 4:51 PM, Russell Hernandez

Hi Richard
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| =poke to them again a week and a half ago they claim they will give us
=omething back.... | told them if we did not get it by the first week of =pril that | was going to recommend to you guys to
dispute the charge =ince it was a CC charge | will get you an update next week

Russell =ernandez

On Mar 28, =018, at 3:38 PM, Richard Kahn _wmte:

any update on credit?
please=advise
thank you

Richard Kahn

On Mar 16, 2018, at 6:01 PM, Russell Hernandez

Hi Richard no update =et
I 'will get us a credit
are you ok if they give us a credit on the CC as =ell

Thanks

Russell Hernandez

On Mar 16, 2018, at 12:38 PM, Richard Kahn_

any updates from Rimco on credit amount =nd when we will receive money
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also confirm if they =ill wire back funds or fed ex check
thanks

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

On Mar 15, 2018, at 10:33 AM, Russell Hernandez

Got it

Russell Hernandez

On Mar 15, 2018, at 10:32 AM, Richard Kahn _
I, o

yes please request refund as we will not =e proceeding with Rimco

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

On Mar 14, 2018, at 9:02 PM, Russell Hernandez
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They were waiting to see if they =ot the repair if they are not getting it | will get
us the credit which =s not my responsibility by my commitment

Russell Hernandez

wrote:

s s o

contrary to your promise we have received =0 back from Rimco which is clearly
your responsibility..

please advise

thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK =ssociates Inc.
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