
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, January 15, 2016 5:07 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: N9081E TCAS 

Ok 

On Friday, 15 January 2016, Richard Kahn < > wrote:<=r> 

pleas= advise if ok to pay 41,966.72 for TCAS 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px:margin-right:0px:margin-bottom:0px:margin-left:=px">From: Larry Viso=ki 
<javascript:_e(%7B%7D,icvml 8d1=9;);» 

Subject: Fwd: N9081E T=AS 

Date: <=span>January 14, 2016 at 1:23:20 PM EST 

To: le vacation <jeevacation@gmail.com>, Rich Kahn < 

Yeimi Montoya 

Avionics Administrator<=pan style="font-size:12.0ptfont-family:"Times New Roman",8tquo=;serif—> 

Dedicated to earning customer loyalty through excellence in aviatio= services. 

Banyan Air Services, Inc.</=> 
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main direct fax 

www.banyanair.com <javascript:_erh7B%7D,icvmr, );> 

<=table> 

--= 

please not= 

The information contained in this communication is confidentia=, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information,=and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property o= JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communicatio= or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you=have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately=by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.co=> , and destroy this communi=ation and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all=rights reserved 
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