
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Frida , April 13, 2018 9:57 PM 
To: ; Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Question 

ok 

On Fri, Apr 13, 2018 at 4:10 PM, <mailto: » wrote: 

Hello Jeffrey , 
Hope you are doing great !</=ont> 
I just spoke to Rich Kahn and he said that on the =ax day I have to pay the tax amount approximately is 1200$... 

May = ask you if there chance to reimburse me the money , I'm very tigh= with it and have to pay the pt 
program , so I'm very worried abou= extra spending as 1200 $ is a lot , 

Thank you. 

please note 

The inf=rmation contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorne=-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended =nly for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unaut=orized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part the=eof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received th=s communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-m=il or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all co=ies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved<=r> 
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