
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Sunday, January 3, 2016 8:03 PM 
To: Kathy Ruemmler 
Subject: Re: 

we would have to review coop financials in any casear> 

On Sun, =an 3, 2016 at 2:58 PM, Kathy Ruemmler =t; wrote: 

=aintenance = $7,073; tax deductible: 47% 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 3, 2016, at 11:27 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jee=acation@gmail.com» wrote:ar> 

you can bid si= with an all cash close in 2 weeks. . =ont worry you have no obligation until there is a 
signed deal 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com<ta, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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