From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Wednesday, December 30, 2015 8:06 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: shelley

Yes

wr=te:

=hall i pay from your personal account?
please advise
thank y=u

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022
t
f
C

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: Re: for Rich

Date: Decemb=r 30, 2015 at 2:50:35 PM E5ST

To: Richard Kahn

Hi Rich, please see attached the invoice with de=ails included. Please let me know if

you need any=more info. Happy New Year. Shelley
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please=note

The information contained in this communication is
confide=tial, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside informat=on, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the proper=y of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communic=tion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If=you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immedia=ely by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmai=.com>, and
destroy this com=unication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright =all rights reserved
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