
From: Lawrence Krauss 
Sent: Saturday, April 7, 2018 5:24 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Cc: Lawrence Krauss 
Subject: Re: 

Thanks very much.. very kind.. might take you up on it. =nbsp; Their office came back yesterday with rude note saying 
this =as it.. they would question me and I would answer.. Justin wrote =ack and said in that case we will reschedule. 
They said maybe =ot. He wrote back and said yes. So will see Monday.. If no, = will have to pay for another trip to 
phoenix later this =onth. 

On Apr =, 2018, at 4:16 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

if you would like me to pay for nancy to accompany you = happy to do so. . not sure what couldnt get through 
=e telephone means. we should know if there will be =nother meeting. . or is this it. if another when , =ho will attned. 
, can you bring lawyer. etc 

please =ote 

The information contained in this =ommunication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this 
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmailcom, and 
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

Lawrence M. =rauss 
Director, The Origins Project at ASU 
Co-Director, Cosmology Initiative 
Foundation Professor 
School of Earth & Space Exploration and Ph sics =epartment Arizona State University, P.O. Box =71404, Tempe, AZ 
85287-1404 Research Officer Assistant (Jessica): Origins Office (Cynthia): 
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-Origins Project =0 Year Celebration-
Be a part of =omething 10 years in the making! 
April 5.9th 2018 — Visit for more info <https://www.originsl0year.com/> 
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