
From: brice gordon c > 
Sent: Friday, April 13, 2018 11:55 AM 
To: jeffrey E.; Richard Kahn; 
Subject: Fwd: CustomerOrder#H3501-95866.pdf 

I would like to have conversation about thi= and the Palms Thank you 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

=blockquote type="cite"> 
From: Richard Kahn 
Date: A=ril 13, 2018 at 7:17:51 AM AST 
To: brice gordon 
Cc: Daph=e Wallace 
Subject: Re: CustomerOrder#H3501-95866.pdf 

<=div> <mailto 

wrote: 

on 6 pack of lights please advi=e how many purchased so far 
in addition of 1000 lights how m=ny will be used and how many for inventory 

please explain why invoice can not be produc=d with LSJ info which will be needed for tropical.. 
ad=itionally i want to see a shipping number 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Le=ington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On A=r 13, 2018, at 6:42 AM, brice gordon 

attached revised ord=r for both solar and home decorator lights for Isj. 
can we proceed with order? 

On Tue, Apr 10= 2018 at 8:59 AM, Richard Kahn • • wrote: 

EFTA_R1_01590293 
EFTA02476710



w=ll this be sent to tropical? if so is there a shipping cost? 
=if going to tropical is tax applicable as we are sending to STT? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

<mailt 
9, 2018, at 12:53 PM, brice gordon 
> wrote: 

> As requested Estimate for 500 landscape 
> Lights 
> Please disregard name !! 
> Can we proceed 

> <CustomerOrder$H3501-95866.pdf> 

> Sent from my iPhone 

=div dir="ltr" class=""> 
Brice Gordon 
=b class="">The Saint James Group 
11=VI 

Ph
<LSJ Solar and Land=cape Lights.pdf> 
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