
From: brice gordon 
Sent: Saturday, April 14, 2018 12:36 AM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: LS1 Protekt Storm Shutter Repair 

Thank you 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 13, 2018, at 7:59 PM, je=frey E. <jeevacation@gmail.comaa» wrote: 

<mailtojeevacation@gmail.com> 

Yes 

On Fri, Apr 13, 2018 at 6=53 PM brice gordon > wrote: 

Rich 
<=1" 
Attached for you review 
Proposal for the Repair and Replacement of Storm Shu=ters for LSJ 
additional cost to proposa=, electrical connect to Power plant unit, this will be done in house<=div> 
the repairs to master bedroom and pool c=bana will take 
1 day @ $40.00 per=hour x 2 guys = $640.00 
noting r=pair work requires unit to be removed and re installed 

Estimated lead time=4 weeks 

How do you wish to proceed? 

Brice Gordon 

Brice Gordon=/strong> 
The Saint James Group 
USVI 

Ph 
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Brice Gordon 
The S=int James Group 
USVI 

Ph: 

&=bsp; please note 

The information contained in thi= communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, mayconstitute inside 
information, and is intended only for the use of the a=dressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, disclosure or 
co=ying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 

communication in error, p=ease notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, an= 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all att=chments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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