
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Tuesday, December 15, 2015 3:02 PM 

Re: 

i am happy to pay for her first class tickets = she normally flies biz , but asking her to work on holiday I think =t is the 
right thing to do. 

On Tue, Dec 15, 2015 at 9:51 AM, wrote:=br> 

Thk you and Fanny will get in touch with Kathy to coordinate 

Ariane de Rothschild 

Le 15 dec. 2015 a 15:17, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevaca=ion@gmail.com» a acri= : 

https://www.google.comfil ights/Rsearch;f=GVA,ZHT;t=3DPHX,AZA;d=2015-12-21;r= 2016-01-
04;sel=GVALHR0BA725-LHRPHX0BA289 <https://www.google.com/flights/Rsearch;f=GVA,=HT3=PHX,AZA;d=2015-12-
217=2016-01-04;sel=GVALHR0BA725-LHRPHX0BA2=9> 

please =ote 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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