From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Wednesday, December 9, 2015 5:20 PM

To: Larry Visoski

Suhject: Re: Mautica / Nick's Creative Marine_L5) nautica_AMX_12/9/2015
Ok

On Wednesday, 9 December 2015, Larry Visoski _umte:

Jeffrey and Rich,
Just M=t with Nick at Creative Marine Attached is final invoice to prep boat for =ea Trial. Ed stated to Rich and |
verbally that he will deduct this amount=from $90k purchase price.

Mick's invoic= includes installing and Ops checking generator and air conditioner.
=div=Ed will deliver Generator to Nick tomorrow for install and ops check t=is week,

Next phase is measure for New Tubes inst=Il and have Fiberglas repair of rear deck.
I'm trying to kee= positive labor moving fwd in this project.

Ed indicates h="ll have contract tomorrow for review.

=hank you,
Larry

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: robert widmann -

Date: December 9, 2015 at 11:20:12 AM EST

!U!jEEl:

Reply-To: robert widmann ||| GG

The attached inv=ice is where we are at today.
Thank you,
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=C24¢p please note

The information containe= in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileg=d, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the u=e of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disc=osure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly =rohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communicati=n in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail =o jeevacation@g=ail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com: , and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
=ncluding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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