From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 9, 2015 5:20 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: STC accounting invoice

Ok

On Wednesday, 9 December 2015, Richard Kahn || EEGTTTERNGEGEGEGEGEGEEE o=

pl=ase advise if ok to pay Alan’s October 2015 accounting invoice in =he amount of 18,050
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: Fwd: sou=hern invoices

=ate: December 3, 2015 at 12:37:47 PM EST

To: Richard =ahn _

Hi Rich,

Here is the October billing.
Hope you =re well and are enjoying this time of year.

We should begin I=oking at the January estimate.
Best,

D

EFTA_R1_01592861
EFTA02478355



Sent f=o0m my Verizon Wireless 4G LTE smartphone

-------- Original mess=ge --------
From: Cindy LLBiz
Date: 12/03/2015 11:06 AM (GMT-05:00)

Subject: southern invoices

-—--0riginal Message----

From: scanner

Sent: Thursday,=December 3, 2015 10:35 AM

To: Cindy LLBiz

Subject: Message from &quo=;RNPD0267349D694"

This E-mail was sent from "RNP0O0267343D=9A" (Aficio MP 2852).

Scan Date: 12.03.2015 10:34:39 I-DEDDIQueries m_

<=blockquote>

=C24p  please note

The informat=on contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only =or
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and
destroy this communication and all copies =hereof,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

</=iv>

EFTA_R1_01592862
EFTA02478356



