From: Larry Visoski ([ GG

Sent: Saturday, December 12, 2015 3:21 PM
To: jeffrey E.

Cc: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: TCAS upgrade required B727
Jeffrey,

You are correct,

My mistake= Dec 1st for TCAS 7.1,,, | read Dec 31st for Stage |l aircraft noise ban. &=bsp;

Larry Morrison should have reminded me this date was approaching, his=reasoning for not brining to my attention, was
“its only required in Europe=, | explained that we have to be able to fly to Paris, and what was he thin=ing?

It's my e=ror at the end of the day!

My apologies.

=his does not effect a flight from LSJ - Marrakesh - Acores - or NY area.&nb=p;

I'll have pricing from Banyan Avionics shop Monday, for upgrade and or e=change, | expect more competitive pricing,
since they hold the 5T=for TCAS 7.1

Mike Robinson at Boca Aircraft Maintenance informs:<=div> Larry, You have a= RT-920 TCAS processor |:_
-]., For that unit to have 7.1 softwar=, we would need to convert it to a -914. You can either exchange yours or
u=grade.

Thx

Larry

=br=Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 12, 2015, at 6:01 AM, jeffrey E= <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> >=wrote:

this sa=s excahnge or uprgrade. what does upgrade mean. ?&n=sp; new or modifcation

On Fri, Dec 11, 2015 at 9:19 PM, Larry Visoski <[ = <mailto - > wrote:

=divz=leffrey,
Europe airspace is requiring to have TCAS 7.1 softwa=e installed by Jan 1st, 2016 for the B727.

U=5, Airspace is not required to have TCAS 7.1 until year 2020,

Cost for software upgrade to 7.1 TCAS is 560,511 (due to a=e and Mod status of B727 TCAS unit, we
have to upgrade our box before 7.1 s=ftware could be installed).

We have 7.1 TCAS=already installed in GIV, when we upgraded to DUBS5.
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< =jv>
| will have another price quote on Monday from Banyan Avionics Fort=Lauderdale.

Boca Aircraft Mx quote is $60,51=00

Thx
Larry

=div>

Larry,<=p=
=fu=

S0 you have an RT-920 TCAS process=r :_]. For that unit to have 7.1 software, we would
need to c=nvert it to a -914. You can either exchange yours or upgrade it. Here are t=e prices for the options we
discussed:

STC package paper work. $13,075.00
Exchange TCAS w/7.1=/p>
547,000.00

Labor 5436.00

<=r>

Total $60,511.00

<= class="MsoNormal" style="margin:0in Oin 0.0001pt">

About 3-4 four hours are required to do the work and paperwor=.

So if you&=hsp;exchange it, you are looking at $60,511 pl=s shipping.
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Feel free t= ring me if you have any questions.

Boca Aircraft Maintenance

I -

=span style="background-color:rgba(255,255,255,0)">145.6261=/p>
BDA/AMO/409

=nbsp;
Sent from my iPhone

<=r clear="all"=>

=nbsp; please note

The informati=n contained in this communication is

confidential, may be attorney-clien= privileged, may

constitute inside information, and is intended only for=br>the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized u=e, disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof is st=ictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

commus=ication in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-=ail to jeevacati=n@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and

destroy this communication and all copies thereof,<=r=including all attachments, copyright -all rights reserved

=/div>
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