From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Tuesday, November 24, 2015 3:23 PM

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Rodriguez Family - Annual Health Insurance coverage - November 23, 2015
ok

On Tue, Nov 24, 2015 at 9:53 AM, Richard Kahn r
wrote:

please advise if ok to pay carlos’ =nnual family health insurance in the amount of 7,092 obtained via his wife=
job
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

==iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">From: Daphne
Wal=ace <dlbwalla=e@gmail.com <mailto:dlbwallace@gmail.com= >

<=>5Subject: Rodriguez Family - Annual Health Insuranc= coverage - November 23, 2015
Date: November 23, 2015 at 12:27:12 PM =5T

To: =span style="font-family:-webkit-system-font,Helvetica Neue Helvetica,san=-serif">Rich Kahn <
<mailto:richardkahnl12@gmail.com>

=C24) please note
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The information contained in this communication =5
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute in=ide information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It =s the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of thi=
communication or any part thereof s strictly prohibited
and may be=unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please noti=y us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jee=acation@gmail.com=> , and
des=roy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachment=. copyright -all rights reserved
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