From: Ann Rodriguez <annrodriquez@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 12, 2015 1:27 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Fwd: Stone nook

Sent from my iPhone
Begin=forwarded message:

From:=Ann Rodriquez <annrodriquez@ya=o0.com <mailto:annrodriquez@yahoo.com> >
Date: November 12, 2015 at 9:25:30 AM AST

To= Richard Kahn <pg ; ; i
Cc: Daphne Wallac

Subject: Re: St=ne nook

Hi=Rich,

Mr. Renol is not one of our normal Vendors, he's a Independent contr=ctor that we normally pay once the jobis
completed.

| can ask him t= wait 1-2weeks but | don't think he would be in a agreement with me. <=div>

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 12, 2015, at 9=08 AM, Richard Kahn < - >

wrote:

<=gta http-equiv="content-type" content="text/html; charset=us-ascii"><=iv=| don't know why vendors
need to be paid the day they finish a job and n=t wait the normal 1-2 weeks everyone else does,

Sent from my i=hone

On Nov 12, 2015, at 7:42 AM, Ann Rodriguez <

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded=message:
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From: "jeffrey E=" <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com= >=
Date: November 12, 2015 at 8:32:28 AM AST

Subject: Re: Stone noo
<mailto:annrodriquez@yahoo.com:>

yes

On Thu, Nov 12, 2015 at 1:23 PM, An= Rodriquez <k e
I - - . ote:

Completed.

Please advise payment for 51,000 ?
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Sent from my iPhone

==iv class="gmail_signature">
= please note

The information contained in this communic=tion is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitu=e inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee.=It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of t=is
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may b= unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please noti=y us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeev=cation@gmail.com>, and
destr=y this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. c=pyright -all rights reserved

=/body>
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