
From: Heather Gray < 
Sent: Tuesday, November 10, 2015 9:04 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein (jeevacation@gmail.com) 
Subject: Gagosian payments 

Sorry, Jeffrey, I thou=ht I forwarded this to you yesterday, but just found it still in draft for=. Gagosian's lawyer told me 
on the phone that Larry paid over =o Maya Picasso the amount we paid him in each installment less Larry's commission 
(which Larry told Leon is 6%).&n=sp; 

We paid Gagosian:=/o:p> 

$23 million on May 12<=:p> 

$34.5 million on June =9 

$28.75 million on Octo=er 1 

Please let me know if =ou have any questions. 

Best, 

Heather 

From: Krista Evans [mailto 
Sent: Monday, November 09 2015 5:04 PM 
To: Heather Gray 
Subject: 

=On Behalf Of Matthew Dontzin 

Heather: 

Here is the information you requested: </a 

Gagosian Gallery Inc. made payments on three dates t= Maya Widmaier Picasso: 
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May 19, 2015 

July 1, 2015 

October 1, 2015 

As you surmised, the payments roughly correspond to =he payments made by LB to Gagosian. 

Regards, 

Matthew 
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