
From: Richard Joslin < > 
Sent: Wednesday, November 11, 2015 12:20 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Cc: Joe Avantario; Brad Wechsler 
Subject: RE: 

Please clarify "renew" question. 

From: Jeffrey E. <jeev=cation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 11, 2015 4:59 AM 
To: Richard Joslin; Joe Avantario; Brad Wechsler 
Subject: 

lets calculate the exact payoff amount for the leon note as of &=bsp; nov 30 ,DEC1 , dec 31. 1) does art spa=e get 
folded in to phaidon. . middle cos disolved.? 2 co=lapse topco etc 
open bank accounts for apoo 

interest will be approx 50k per day . look at deduction. 
note payoff docs- notaries . new docs. = releases ? , accountings? disclosures? ( gaming ? ) art partn=rship . renew. 

will? repaper lease guarantees? macfarlan=s. ? do we pay down 10m. of plane. ? proposal for airplane ,&n=sp; 91, 
135. exec , jet. .? remove debra. from plane? 

please note 
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