From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, October 30, 2015 5:28 PM
To: Lvjet
Subject: Re: BBJ I

did we get a date for the bbj to fly from basel?

=div class="gmail_extra">

On Fri, Oct 30, 2=15 at 12:06 PM, Lvjet <||| | |G <G -: - v rote:

Gary informs the BBl yo= showed interest some time ago is still available, their deal fe=| threw, original issue
with this BBJ2- large inspections were due when yo= look at the aircraft,. the 144month and BC checks are completed
now,. ori=inal deals was trade B727 +530.5M

see Gary's note below,.

photos attached

thx

Larry

-----=riginal Message-----

From: Gary Anzalone < < >

To: LVIET@aol.com < = Bl= < = =<=r> Sent: Fri, Oct
30, 2015 11:51 am

Subject: BBJ ||

Here =re the details again on the BBJ II.

MOTE:=The times are the same except the 144M and 8C are now completed.

They =ad previously agreed to trade at 30.5 difference, but that was without the=inspections included. | recall
that we were estimating 2 million dollars t= be safe,

Let m= know JE's thoughts.
Since=ely,

<https://docs.google.com/uc?export=download&a=p;id=0B-9vjdWRZbjbNGRzNnRCSVJILXc&revid=0B-
SvjdWRZbjbaVNOSkN6aGOvR=2vZGZXL200RXFON204MTRNPO>

<http://t.sidekickopen03.com/el=/o/5/f18dQhb057ksBdDMPbW 2n0x6I2B9g XrN7sKjevALTSMWEgmOPFEg-6-
ENSpThB4d3 _yKW=bOkxQlk1HEHO?si=63172147989708808&pi=113363f1-b396-4707-da81-961752=90c79=
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=lease note

The information contained in this communication is c=nfidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside in=ormation, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this co=munication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawf=I. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us i=mediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacatio=@gmail.com> , and destroy th=s communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copy=ight -all rights reserved
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