
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursda , A ril 5, 2018 9:40 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: Tim Dollan 

How much is the labor? 

On Thu, Apr 5, 2018 at 11:20 PM wrote: 

Jeffrey 
Just received a call from Ed Saltzman, Tim Dolan's pilot 
He's asking if $2.7M plus he'll pay for the 72month i=spection labor, and we cover discrepancies„ 

How should I respond to Ed? 

I also spoke with Dan Jenkins today, he said he's preparing an LOI =s well, (mr Polina buyer, former 
USAmbassador to Africa somewhere)?? 

Thx 

Sent from my iPhone 

=AO please note 

The information contained in this=communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, mayconstitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the=addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or=copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibite= and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in err=r, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com<=a>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including=all attachments. 
copyright -all rights reserved 
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