
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 4, 2015 9:06 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Quotation on F300 x 3 incl. installation 

ok 

On Wed, Nov 4, 2015 at 4:05 PM, Richard Kahn =lt; <mailto 
wrote: 

sportis and little c engines 
i was able =o reduce price from 73,267 to 70,601 

please=advise if ok to proceed 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

> > 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">From: "Hara=d Tapp" 

< 

Subject: Quotation on F300 x 3 incl. inst=llation 

Date: =/b>November 4, 2015 at 3:58:07 PM EST 

To: "'Rich=rd Kahn." < <mailto 

Cc: "'Carlos Rodrigue=1" > 

Hello Rich, 

> > 

as per our conversation earlier at=ached you will find the revised quotation for three Yamaha F300s 
including=basic installation on the Sportis and Little C. 
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=div class="MsoNormal"> 
Any additional =arts like steering components, batteries etc. for the Sportis - if needed = will be invoiced 

separately since we do not know at this point how the bo=t will arrive. 

Please feel free to contact me with any question= or comments. 

Best regards, 

Harald Tapp =C2 =AO =AO =C2 =AO 
8185 Subbase 
St. Thoma=, USVI 00802 

=AO <=u> 
<= href="http://www.offshorevi.com" target="_blank">www.offshorevi.com</=> 

</=iv> 

please note 

Th= information contained in this communication is confidential, may be at=orney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is inte=ded only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE =nauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any par= thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
receiv=d this communication in error, please notify us immediately by retur= e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and a=l copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights rese=ved 
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