From: -

Sent: Monday, November 2, 2015 11:48 PM
To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Re: Fall School payment changes
Thank you!!!

Thank you

On Mov 2, 2015, at 6:22 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jee=acation@gmail.com> > wrote:

we will pay total of bmcc &nb=p; you have done well

on Mon, Nov 2, 2015 at 6:0¢ v, | -

wrote:

Good=evening Jeffrey and Richard!

On 06/23/2015 Richard made my school tuition psyment for Fall semester in New York City College of
Te=hnology (CityTech).

Later on I've got a full time job and couldn't take some of those=classes, so | dropped two of them, and register
for the same- but =eekend classes in Borrow of Manhattan Community Col=ege/ BMCC- WHICH 15 ALSO CUNY /City
college. | thought my paymes=t will be automatically transfered, but today | receive an email f=om BMCC which says that
I have a balance due of $1714.95 and a $51136.=5 credit from City Tech. | called City Tech and they say that there i= no
way money can be transferred. They will make a refund and money will be=on your account by the end if this week,
Unfortunately | cannot make a=y changes myself because payment wasn't made from my account. Could you ple=se
whenever you receive the return make another payment towers BMCC? <=span>

I'm very sorry f=r the confusion and inconvenience !!!!

Thank you =

= please note

The information contained in this communication is =onfidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside in=ormation, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the p=operty of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this comm=nication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.=If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immed=ately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmas=l.com= , and destroy this com=unication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -=ll rights reserved
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