
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, October 23, 2015 1:57 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Bobcat 

ok 

On Fri, Oct 23, 2015 at 9:56 AM, Richard Kahn > wrote: 

going forward please present jee total cost= as opposed to portion of cost 
is 1,000 core charge guaranteed to be r=turned? 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971-13064a> 

On Oct 22 2015 at 9:15 PM, Ann Ro=riquez 
wrote: 

Sor=y, it's a core charge. 
When they receive our engine they wil= refund us $1,000.00 and the $250 charge is the Shipping to 

Tropical=Florida. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 22, 2015, a= 6:16 PM, Richard Kahn 
> wrote: 

please explain 5230 vs 3995 
thank you 
<=r> 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 
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, 2015, at 1:55 PM, Daphne=Wallace 
wrote: 

Greetings Ri=h, 

JE approved the purchase of a used engine for the Bo=cat - $5,230.00. JE's approval is below, 
DW 

=/div> 
Forwarded message 

From: Ann Rodriquez < 
Date: Thu, Oct 22, 201 . --
Subject: Fwd: Bobcat 
To: Daphne Wallace < 

<=r> 
Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 
=br> 

From: "Jeffrey E."= <jeevacatio=@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 
Date: October 22, 2015 at 9:09:59 AM AST 
<=>To: ann rodriquez < 
Subject: Re: Fw: B=bcat 

ok 

On Thu, Oct 22, 2015 at 9:01 AM, ann rodriquez <

Hey Bossman, 

Tap and Karl are suggesting =hat we buy a Used Engine for the Bobcat because 
the salt has gone through =he entire Engine as well. I wont need to purchase the Fuel Syste= from "Bobcat of Miami" for 
the $8,043.00. 

The suggested Engine would come completed with =uel System, Injectors and 
Pumps The total amount for this used engine is $=,955.00 not including shipping. 
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http://www.ebay.com/itm/Kubota-V3800-Turbo-Diesel-
Used/331638506472?_t=ksid=p2047675.c100009.m1982&_trkparms=aid%3D777000%26algo%3DABA.M B=%26ao%3 D1 
%26asc%3D33872%26meid%3Df7be67b4bdbf41598d5e287ea2192d7b%26pid%3D=00009%26rk%3D1%26rkt%3D1%26s 
d%3D231375046826 <http://www.ebay.com/itm/Kubota-V3800-Turbo-Diesel-
Used/=31638506472?_trksid=p2047675.c100009.m1982&_trkparms=aid%3D777000%=6algo%3DABA.MBE%26ao%3D1 
%26asc%3D33872%26meid%3Df7be67b4bdbf41598d5e287ea2=92d7b%26pid%3D100009%26rk%3D1%26rkt%3D1%26s 
d%3D231375046826> 

Please Advise, 
Ann R. 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained i= this e-mail may be 
privileged,confidential, and protected from disclosure= If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified 
that any d=ssemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly=prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notif= the sender immediately and delete all copies.<=div> 

On Wednesday, October 21, 2015 2=08 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com 
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

ok 

On Wed, Oct 21, 2015 at 2:03 PM, ann rodriquez 
On Mon=ay, October 19, 2015 3:14 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@g=ail.com 

<mailto:jeevacation=gmail.com> wrote: 

Change 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to --
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com= rel=> 

4>=A0 please note 

The information containe= in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-=lient privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and=is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the=property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disc=osure or copying of this 
communication or any part there=f is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you hav= received this 
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communica=ion and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. c=pyright -all rights reserved 
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40=A0 please note 

The information conta=ned in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privi=eged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
th= use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, d=sclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strict=y prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communic=tion in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-ma=l to jeevacatio=@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,<=r>including all 

attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

ar> 

=C2® please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have 

received this 
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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