
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, October 16, 2015 8:25 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Palm Beach Driveway 

ok 

On Fri, Oct 16, 2015 at 4:23 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

i was ab=e to negotiate Monarck price of 11,070 to 9,000 
i was told materials alone were 6,200 for epoxy 
work will take 4 days to complete 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

=AO please note 

The information contained in this communicati=n is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute=inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. =t is the property of JEE Unauthorized 
use, disclosure or copying of =his communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may=be unlawful. If you 
have received this communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com anailto:=eevacation@gmail.com> , and =estroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachm=nts. copyright -all rights reserved 
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