From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

send them the wire instructions

jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >
Wednesday, October 14, 2015 6:37 PM
Richard Kahn

Re: Martin Nowak

wrote:

Brad an= Lauren response to my email today was that they needed wiring instruction= which were included in
original pledge {dec 2014} and resent on 10/7/2015=div=] have not yet reconfirmed with Martin yet response that they
sent ask=ng for wiring instructions was silly..

Shall i reach out to Mart=n or do you want to address in meeting this afternoon..

Please a=vise
Thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

Leima=

them?<=>

Jas

<tel
<te

<=iv style="word-wrap:break-word">

Begin forwarded message:

Hi Richard,=/div=

>

=span style="font-family:-webkit-system-font,'Helvetica Neue',Hel=etica,sans-serif">=From: Lauren

Hope you are well. We have requested=the wire instructions for the payment. Do you have access to

We are ready to send the wire=as soon as we receive the instructions.
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Thank you,
Lauren

Lauren C. Leima=
Elysium Management L=C
E: <=

P:

< f=>

<=>From: Ri=hard Kahn (ma=Ito | |

Sent: Wednesday, Oct=ber 14, 2015 12:16 PM

To: Brad Wechsler Ce: Lauren Leiman _

<mailto
Subject: Re: M=rtin Nowak

please advise if you have an= updates
thank you

Richard Kahn

New York, NY 10022

tel tel
f= tel
ce <te

=/blockquote>

Begin forwarded message:

From: Richard Kahn

Subject:

fa tel
ce <te

On Oct 7, 2015, at 3:31 PM, Brad We=hsler —
-::mailtc::_:: = wrote:

Rich-let me track it down. Who was the donee?
Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry
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From: Richard Kahn

Date: Tue, 6 Oct 2015 19:34:11 -0400

Subject: Martin Nowa

Please advise if remaining 1,000,000 was sent.
Thank you

Rich

From: Martin Nowak. Y -
Date: Wednesday, September 30, 2015=at 3:55 PM

Dear Richard

Thank you so much fo= the great support of our program by the Leon Black

Foundation. Last year =ou kindly sent us 4M of the 5M pledge.

The letter said that=you would send the remaining 1M by end of September

2015. Is this correct?=/div>
Many thanks and best=wishes

Martin

pl=ase note

The information contained in this communication is
con=idential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside info=mation, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the pr=perty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
comm=nication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful= If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us imm=diately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@=mail.com> , and

3

EFTA_R1_01603024
EFTA02484828



destroy thisscommunication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyri=ht -all rights reserved
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