From: rad edwards <

Sent: Friday, October 9, 2015 8:38 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

We just got a call from Dersh agreeing to the settlement and to agree =o a joint public statement which would be the
limit of what anyone would s=y. 77?7

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 8, 2015, at 5:06 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gms=il.com> > wrote:

and also called dersh lawyers , no worry.,

wrote:

For what it's worth, probably nothing, that newspaper called him.

sent from my iPhone

On Oct 8, 2015, at 4:26 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gms=il.com> >
wrote:

or was this the offer of settlement. . e=ther way, nothelpful, funny but you andi,=get
along better than others

please note

The information contained in this communication is

confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may

constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

please note
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