
From: Bard President 
Sent: Wednesday, April 4, 2018 1:44 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

To whom and what address should the check b= made out 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 4, 2018, at 9:40 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacat=on@gmail.com» wrote: 

yes 

On Wed, Apr 4, 2018 at 3:38 PM, Bard Preside=t samailto > 

Can I pay for it in installments if I pay you 10 000 no=? 

Sent from my i=hone 

On Apr 4, 2018, at 8:21 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> w=ote: 

wrote: 

you can s=ll bck to dealier. or put at auction if the cash is an issue. &n=sp; I guess if need be 
the foundation can take the watch a=d sell it at auction. so if it comes up short it is not your pr=blem. the books of 
the foundation are often reviewed = . sory 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-clie=t privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only fo= 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized u=e, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is st=ictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
commu=ication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-=ail to jeevacati=n@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof,<=r>including all attachments. copyright -all 
rights reserved 

=/div> 

please note 

The inf=rmation contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney=client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended on=y for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthor=zed use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof=is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail or=by e-mail to jee=acation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies the=eof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

=/div> 
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