From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 23, 2015 6:13 PM
To: Lvjet

Subject: Re: Boeing 727 A2 Inspeciton

yes

On Wed, Sep 23, 2015 at 1:16 PM, Lvjet <<= href:"mailta_target:"_blank"_ wrote:

leffrey

may | have your approval to wire Transfer, for Boeing A2 ins=ection payment,.
total due 518,101.07 to BigSky Aviation in Palm Beach.

thank you
Larry

=lease note

The information contained in this communication is c=nfidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside in=ormation, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this co=munication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawf=1. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us i=mediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to

jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacatio=@gmail.com> , and destroy th=s communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copy=ight -all rights reserved
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