
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Wednesday, October 7, 2015 8:12 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: Chrome Books 

please disregard email below as when i checked with Jeanne =he figures Cecile quoted were incorrect 

public school (education) open after =omputers go to Baird = 10,935 non public =charitable) open 8,500 

sorry for confusion 

5013e • Education 
Check 02/17/2015 1387 Liston Network Systems Invoice # 21312: 50% Deposit on Acer 

=hromebook 10002 • First Bank - 21,310.50 
Check 03/23/2015 1401 Liston Network Systems Invoice # 21312: Balance due on Acer 

Chromebook 10002 • First Bank - 21,310.50 
Total 5013e • Education 42,621.00 

% to Virgin Islands Public School 0.33 
14,064.93 

Additional required expenditure =efore 12.3.12015 10,935.07 
=/b> 

50153c • Charitable 
Check 02/09/2015 1375 My Brothers Workshop MBW Bakery & Cafe opening 2015 10002 • First 

Bank - 2,000.00 
Check 02/09/2015 1378 Humane Society of St. Thomas 2015 Valentine Ball - A Masked Affair 10002 • 

First Bank - 1,500.00 
Check 02/09/2015 1379 Community Foundation of the V. I. Cancer Support VI 10002 • First 

Bank - 1,500.00 
Check 02/09/2015 1380 Antilles School, Inc. Gala and annual fund 10002 • First Bank - 
6,000.00 

Check 04/21/2015 1418 St. Thomas All Stars Steel Orchestra Donation for Instruments & Stands 
10002 First Bank 5,000.00 

Check 06/12/2015 1436 Wesley Methodist Church 12th Annual Booklet Ad outreach program 
10002 • First Bank 500.00 
Total 50153c • Charitable 16,500.00 

Additional required expenditure =efore 12.3.12015 8,500.00 =/b> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
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On Oct 7, 2015, at 3:54 PM, Richard Kahn rote: 

Cecile states below we need to fulfill our 50,000 (25,000 to =ublic and 25,000 other) charitable contributions by 
=2/31/2015 

To given thru 10/7/2015: 
13,600 to public school students and 0 to nonpublic =chools 

Contributions to make by 12/31/2015 via STC: 
public 11,400 
non public 25,000 
total = 36,400 

Please advise if we should still proceed with sending chrome =oaks to Baird 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Cecile de Jongh 

Subject: Re: STC computer 

Date: October 6, 2015 at 6:14:02 PM EDT 

To: Richard Kahn 
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Cc: Jeanne Brennan 

Ok. We donated 34 of the 100 lap tops =e purchased. If my memory serves, we paid about $400/unit. 
=nbsp;So that's $13,600 for charitable giving. We need to have a =otal of $50,000/year and half needs to go to public 
schools. The =13,600 in lap tops went to public school students. So we need $11,400 =or public schools and $25,000 for 
other in 2015.1E can give money if =e wants to use the lap tops for something else out of the territory. 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 

Sent from my iPhone and misspellings =ourtesy of iPhone. 

On Oct 6, =015, at 5:48 PM, Richard Kahn rote: 

if there is an issue =ith EDC or purpose then please send note to me or jee before computers =eave so 
he can decide on his options 

thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Oct 6, 2015, at 5:36 PM, Jeanne =rote: 

If we are not using these for our charitable =ontributions. We have to look at this with for the 
public school =equirements. Lets put on the list for when we are all back after the =5th. 

From: Richard Kahn (mailto 
Sent: Tuesday, October 06, 2015 5:33 PM 
To: Cecile delongh 
Cc: Jermaine Ruan 

Subject: Fwd: STC computer 

Jeanne Brennan 
Lesley =roff 

can you please =ake sure we load on plane 66 laptops which should be around October =3/14 
(when jee departs his next STT visit) 

thank =ou 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK =ssociates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
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New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded =essage: 

From: "jeffrey=E." <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 
Subject: Re: STC computer 
Date: October =, 2015 at 5:31:02 PM EDT 
T : = an>Richard Kahn 

put on plane 

On Tue, Oct 6, 2015 at 5:30 PM, =ichard Kahn 

wrote:

Cecile says we have =6 Chromebook Acer C720 lap tops 
Please advise if i should send =11 
Thank you 

http://us.acer.com/ac/en/US/content/series/c720 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, =Y 10022 

Begin forwarded =essage: 

From: Cecile =e longh 

Subject: Re: STC computer 
Date: October =, 2015 at 4:39:54 PM EDT 
To: =/span>Richard Kahn 
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Cc: Jeanne =rennan 
Reply-To: Cecile =e Jongh 

There =re 66 Chromebook Acer C720 lap tops. 

With =arm regards, 

wrote: 

Cecile 

On Tuesday, October 6, 2015 4:19 PM, Richard Kahn 

please =dvise on quantity we have and the computers make model etc 

free =o discuss now if you are available 

thank =ou 

Richard =ahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
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Begin =orwarded message: 

From: "jeffrey=E." <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 

Date: =/span>October 6, 2015 at 7:07:17 AM EDT 

To: gspan>Richard Kahn 
President =It 

send =aptops form stc to bottstein for charter school 

please note 

The =nformation contained in this communication is 
confidential,=may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside =nformation, and is intended only for 
the use of the =ddressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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please =ote 
The information contained in this communication =s 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
TEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of =his 
communication or any part thereof is strictly =rohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received =his 
communication in error, please notify us immediately =y 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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