
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, March 29, 2018 12:24 AM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: GIV update 

No rush at all 

<=iv>On Wed, Mar 28, 2018 at 7:10 PM Larry Visoski < > wrote: 

Pete informs he can have GIV completed Friday„ he would like till Mo=day if you don't need the plane„ 
The Fwd monitor was sent for repair„ estimated return date April 4th 
-according to Pete, the monitor manufacturer is out of business, Eric purch=sed this unit in 2013. 
We have located same units, "as Removed" for $2000 as a bac=up plan, the Company is waiting on monitor 

removal paperwork before it can=be released., 
We can operate without monitor installed, keeping the monitor close o=t Panel shut., 

Is Monday ok for GIV completion? 

Thx 
Larry 
Sent from my iPhone 

=AO please note 

The information contained in this=communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, mayconstitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the=addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or=copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibite= and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in err=r, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com<=a>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including=all attachments. 
copyright -all rights reserved 
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