
From: Richard Kahn <
Sent: Wednesday, March 28, 2018 9:20 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: Rimco 

please advise on reply to russell about getting something =ack? 
paid for 9 days yet only 4 were used? 
=/span> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

On Mar 28, 2018, at 4:51 PM, Russell Hernandez < wrote: 

Hi Richard 
I =poke to them again a week and a half ago they claim they will give us =omething back.... I told them if we did 

not get it by the first week of =pril that I was going to recommend to you guys to dispute the charge =ince it was a CC 
charge I will get you an update next week 

Russell =ernandez 

On Mar 28, =018, at 3:38 PM, Richard Kahn <  wrote: 

any update on credit? 
please=advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
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tel 
fax 
cell 

On Mar 16, 2018, at 6:01 PM, Russell Hernandez ffi  wrote: 

Hi Richard no update =et 
I will get us a credit 
are you ok if they give us a credit on the CC as =ell 

Thanks 

Russell Hernandez 

On Mar 16, 2018, at 12:38 PM, Richard Kahn =It 
<mailto  > wrote: 

any updates from Rimco on credit amount =nd when we will receive money 
also confirm if they =ill wire back funds or fed ex check 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 

On Mar 15, 2018, at 10:33 AM, Russell Hernandez 
wrote: 

Got it 
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Russell Hernandez 

On Mar 15, 2018, at 10:32 AM, Richard Kahn =lt; 
<rnailto: > > wrote: 

yes please request refund as we will not =e proceeding with Rimco 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cet 

On Mar 14, 2018, at 9:02 PM, Russell Hernandez 
wrote: 

They were waiting to see if they =ot the repair if they are not getting it I will get 
us the credit which =s not my responsibility by my commitment 

Russell Hernandez 

On Mar 14, 2018, at 8:48 PM, Richard Kahn =lt 
<mailto: > wrote: 

contrary to your promise we have received =0 back from Rimco which is clearly 
your responsibility.. 

please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK =ssociates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th =loor 
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New York, NY 10022 
tel
xafl

cel
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