
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, October 1, 2015 8:00 PM 
To: Kathy Ruemmler 
Subject: Re: 

http://www.sarawakreport.org/2015/03/why-did-jho-lows-c=mpany-good-star-limited-pay-aabars-top-executive-
khadem-al-qubaisi-usd20-7=-million/ <http://www.sarawakreport.org/2015/03/why-did-jh=-Iows-company-good-star-
I imited-pay-aabars-top-executive-khadem-al-qubaisi=usd20-75-mi I I ion/> 

On Thu, Oct 1, 2015 at 3:40 PM, Kathy Ruemmler 
wrote: 

Left you a message on cell. I am in my office. a hre 
target="_blank"> 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 1, 2015, at 12:1= PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

should w get the colorado woman of the phone?=C2 i have a quick question re ,when you get a 
chance 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmailcom</=>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA_R1_01606692 
EFTA02487249



=C2 please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may c=nstitute inside 
information, and is intended only for the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, disclosure or 
co=ying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

2 

EFTA_R1_01606693 
EFTA02487250


