From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, September 18, 2015 T:52 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: T1st - Projection Screen

doit

On Fri, Sep 18, 2015 at 3:51 PM, Richard Kahn _-:mailta:_ > wrote:

attache= is bid for 115" Grey Motorized Firehawk Projection Screen in the =mount of 12,196 (equipment
6832 labor 4370 and sales tax 994)

=hlockquote type="cite">it was difficult to price check online however i =ound 1 link below (HT Market) - i also
have asked if 115" is custo= size (currently our screen is 113")

i questioned labor which was 38 hours (they said 2-3 men for 2 da=s at 115 per hour) - labor would be
adjusted down if they do not spend all=the time

i have not yet negotiated b=d and believe i can reduce to at least 11,000
estimated time to receive from CA is 2-3 weeks
note this is same company that is currently installing =utron (which should be 90% done by 9/25)
please advise
thank you
http://www.htmarket.com/lumoel.html

http://www.projectorcentral.com/pd=/screens/Stewart-Luxus_Model_A_ElectriScreen.pdf
<http://www.projectorcentral.com/pdf/screens/Stewart-Luxus_Mode=_A_ElectriScreen.pdf=

==jy=http://www stewartfilmscreen.com/applications/home-t=eater-screens/retractable-screens/up-

to-12-image-width/model-a-lx/lxc-for-=ome-cinema <http://www.stewartfilmscreen.com/applications/home-theater-
s=reens/retractable-screens/up-to-12-image-width/model-a-Ix/lxc-for-home-cin=ma>

--=------- Forwarded message ----------From: Robert Finelli _
>

Date: Thu, Sep 17, 2015 at 1:48 PM

To: " A < it I
<> Richard kahn [ <> N

<mailto:
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Cc: Al Buonanno &I=:_mai|tn:_ >, Donna Taylor <
<maito -

€=U

jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communic=tion and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all =ights reserved
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