
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, September 14, 2015 9:43 PM 
To: Ann Rodriquez 
Subject: Re: Big N: Caribbean Battery 

yes 

On Mon, Sep 14, 2015 at 3:06 PM, Ann Rodriquez 
wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

Caribbean battery =elivered 8 batteries to be used for the Launch of Big N but my credit card=was declined. 

Do I have your permission to =se your LSJ Credit Card to pay for the batteries? 

Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Daphne Wallac
Date: September 14, 2015 at 2:42:28 PM AST 
To: ann=rodriquez 
Subject: Caribbean Battery - Se=tember 14, 2015 

Big N needed 8 new batteries torget her ready for launch. 

Caribbean Battery already del=vered them. Need payment today. $1,600. 

Invoice attached, DW 

=br> 

=lease note 
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The information contained in this communication is 
c=nfidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside in=ormation, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
co=munication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawf=l. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us i=mediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacatio=@gmail.com> , and 
destroy th=s communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copy=ight -all rights reserved 
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