
From: Kathy Ruemmler 
Sent: Saturday, September 5, 2015 3:52 AM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

I can't send this. Not me. =1 get that it is business, and I agree, but I do understand law firm econom=cs and there is no 
way they pay me $6 mm without an expectation that I just=fy that. Don't want the pressure or resentment that comes 
from being o=erpaid in the eyes of others at the firm, either there or at Latham. =nly one partner at Latham made over 
$6 mm last year -- corporate guy in Lon=on; brought in @ 80 mm. I will never generate those numbers; no woman=ever 
has, for all of the obvious reasons. 

Sent from my iPhone=/div> 

On Sep 4, 2015, at 6:40 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:=eevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

sorry if i didn't offer more em=tional support , when you felt you needed it. .   to be sen= on sun or mond ( yes i 
know its a holiday ) . to neil&=bsp; / I owe you debt of thanks, y=ur offer of joining hogan seems to have caused 
an o=erdue reevalution of my current posiotn . and i am very grateful. I t=ink we could move the idea to the next leve . 
and ask that you have someone=preapre a fully fleshed out , draft contract that I could consider. &n=sp; OF course I 
assume you recognize that this would have to stay highly co=fidentail 

please not= 

The information contained in this communication is confidential= may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, a=d is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property °NEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or=any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you 
have=received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by jeevacation@gmaitcom 
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication a=d all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
copyright -all rights r=served 
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