
From: Cecile de Jongh < 
Sent: Friday, September 4, 2015 4:44 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: Work in Office 

<=r> 

With warm reg=rds, 

=ecile 

On Friday, September 4, 2015 12:20 PM, jeffrey E= <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

<=r clear="none"> 

Yes 
On Friday, September 4, 2015, Cecile de Jongh < > wrote: 

<=iv> 
</=pan> 
The guys are done with the walls and=the ceilings in the two offices and they are ready to paint. The est=mate 

did not include painting. The quote to paint both offices is =750. We have an additional bill of $1,410 =or the work done 
in the kitchen (lowering the ceiling level and replacing =he tiles with green board to absorb moisture). Please let me 
know whether =e can go ahead and have them paint and pay them for the labor and material= for the kitchen. The total 
for the painting and the kitchen work is=$2,160. 

Additionally, the contractor gave me a quote of $1,750</=trong> to replace the 376 sq ft of ceiling tiles in the 
hallway leadi=g from the kitchen to your office. He would replace the tiles w=th the green board to also absorb the 
moisture and also match the tiles in=the offices and the kitchen. Let me know if you want to proceed with=this part. 

With warm regards, 
=div> 

Cecile 

<=div> 

=lease note 
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The information contained in this commun=cation is confidential, may be attorney-client privilege=, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended onl= for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copyin= of this communication or any part thereof is strictly p=ohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this<=r clear="none">communication in error, please notify us immediately byreturn e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacatio=@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved </=iv> 
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