
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, August 27, 2015 8:55 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Lyn, M, Tes air tickets to Philippiness 

Ok dates? 

On Thursday, August 27, 2015, Richard Kahn &I 
wrote: 

Lynn and have expensed their tickets to Philippines for 825 per ti=ket 
In addition they purchased a ticket for Tes in the amount of 825</=iv> 
Please advise if ok 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">From: 
bellaklein=< <javascript:_e(%78%7D,'cvmUbklein575@gmail.co=1;» 

Subject: Lyn, J=jo, Tes air tickets to Philippiness 

Date: August 27, 2015 at 4:16:55=PM EDT 

To: Richard Kahn < 
<javascript:_e(%7B%7D,icvmr=,' );» 

=font size="3">They purchased 3 tickets and have approval only for Lyn an= Will ask Tes to pay 
back, unless Lyn will ask JE and get her ticket=approved. 
08/19=2015 DONG-A TRAVEL INC NEW YORK NY 825.00 
08/19=2015 DONG-A TRAVEL INC NEW YORK NY 825.00 
08/19=2015 DONG-A TRAVEL INC NEW YORK NY 825.00 

Thank you, 

EFTA_R1_01608578 
EFTA02488517



Bella 

pleas= note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confid=ntial, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside informa=ion, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the prope=ty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communi=ation or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. 1= you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immedi=tely by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtoleevacation@gma=l.com> , and 
destroy this co=munication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright=-all rights reserved 
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