
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, August 27, 2015 10:23 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Allenby Group invoice 8/31/2015 

wait 

On Thu, Aug 27, 2015 at 6:14 PM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

wrote: 

Shall i pay tomorrow or wait until after your visit. P=ease advise. Thank you. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On =ug 26, 2015, at 7:54 PM, Richard Kah 

=/div> 

attached is leighton invoice for Augus= 2015 

labor 4 x 3,365.38 13,461.52 
health insurance 4;0=0\0 = 1,660.00 
food / travel / supplies / 50% hotel expense= 3,771.57 

total 18,=93.10 

please advise if ok to pay from HB=K 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

> 

EFTA_R1_01609691 
EFTA02489301



<=iv style="margin-top:Opx;margin-right:Opx;margin-bottom:Opx;margin-left:=px">From: 
Leighton A=lenby <Iallenby=gmail.com <mailto:lallenby@gmail.com» 

=ubject: Allenby Group invoice 8/31/2015 

Date: =ugust 26, 2015 at 6:17:24 AM EDT 

To: NYC - Richard Kahn 

Cc: Leighton Allenby 

<8_31_2015 Invoice & Health insurance Invoice week - mon=h of August.docx> 

</=iv> 

<Allenby Group rei=bursement August 31 2015 .xlsx> 

=C240 please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only =or 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com 
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 

destroy this communication and all copies =hereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
c/=iv> 
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