
From: Richard Joslin 
Sent: Sunday, August 23, 2015 6:28 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

Will get info on Monday from Peter Goodwin 

On Aug 23, 2015, at 2:10 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@g=ail.com» wrote: 

can you give the details of the filing penalty re uk=cos what did we pay , who signed etc. which cots 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA_R1_01610406 
EFTA02489738


