
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, August 31, 2015 6:29 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Terrence agreement going forward 

do the 75 dollars, must be aproved in advance 

On Mon, Aug 31= 2015 at 1:37 PM, Richard Kahn < 
wrote: 

<mailto 

attached is his threat for hourly charge at 75 per hour (with 2 hour =inimum) without a contract in place.. 
note we did 3 month trial at 250= per month and now he is proposing 3500 per month which is crazy.. 
please advise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue=C24>4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax >cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Terrence =absatt <mailto: 

Subject: LSJ 
=/span> 
Date: August 30, 2015 at 3:53:33 PM EDT 

To: Richard Kahn <mailto >, Jermaine Ruan 
  , Jeanne Brennan <mailto >, Cecile deiongh 

= Ann Rodriquez mailto 

Good day all, 

I just set a new threshold =or the link on the gym. I had Anna and everybody on 151 stream something s= 
I could get a good reading. I hope this holds up now until we can replace=it. I still have it on manual modulation, so I will 
continue to monitor th= link. Times like these is when I lose on a service contract. Please note =omorrow is the 31st and 
my service contract expires then. We don't hav= a new one in place. If I do have to work without it, you will be charged 
=75.00 per hour with a minimum charge of 2 hrs. 
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<=iv>Regards, 

Terrence Rabsatt 
T's Computer Services 
The Smarthome Guys 
"We ut the Brains in our Home" 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="margin-top:Opx;margin-right:Opx;margin-bottom:Opx;margin-left:=px">From: 
Leighton A=lenby < <mailto 

=ubject: Fwd: 'TCS- STC-LSJE Letter Agreement28d4=9; 

Date: <=span>August 28, 2015 at 10:02:25 PM EDT 

To: NYC - Richard Kahn &=t <mailto 

R=chard Kahn <jeevacation@gmail.com 
<mailto and 

destroy this communic=tion and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all =ights reserved 
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