From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Thursday, August 27, 2015 12:01 AM

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Luton - Progress Payment Request $58,750.00
yes

On Wed, Aug 26, 2015 at7:56 PM, Richard kahn N

wrote:

Please advise if ok to pay progress paymen= of 58,750 (25% of job costs)
Balance due upon completion of job=will be 58,750
Thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

bcrtmm:Dpx:margin-left::px":-me_

Subject: Progress Payment Request 558,750.=0

Date: </=pan>August 24, 2015 at 11:00:11 AM EDT

Dear Richard,
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Please find attached =ur summary statement requesting a progress payment of $58,750.00, along wi=h
wiring instructions.

If you have=any questions please don't hesitate to contact me. (Please n=te correct wiring instructions)

Donna Taylor

=p class="MsoMNormal">Controller

C=arity Custom, Inc.

</=iv=

<=div=>

®=~A0 please note

The information contained in this communication is<=r=confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute insid= information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It is =he property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of thiscommunication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited

and may be un=awful. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify =s immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevac=tion@gmail.com= , and

destro= this communication and all copies thereof,

including all attachments, =opyright -all rights reserved
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