From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Wednesday, September 2, 2015 11:31 AM

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Jege, LLC pilotservice_$6000_BrianHoffner

ok

On Wed, Sep 2, 2015 at 7:19 AM, Richard kahn - ERRRERR
wrote:

Attached is Brian Hoffner invoice for 6518.62

I=cludes 3 flying days, 2 idle days and 1 test flight all billed at 1000 per=day. Also hotel in Nyc as no guest apts
were available and 113 dinner bill=d to us for 87.

Please advise if on to pay.=C2¢
Thank you

Sent from my iPhone=/div>

Begin forwarded message:

From: Larry Visoski <5

Date: September 1, 2015 at =:48:09 PM EDT
- B , Bella Klein
&=t; =
Subject: Jege, LLC pilotservice 56000 BrianHoffne=

Pilot service

Brian Hoffner

Labo= and hotel/meal expense.,

Brian had to stay in hotel since no 30= apt available in NY,

Approved

Thx
Larry

Sent from my iPhone
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Begin forwarded message:

Date: September 1, 2015 at 11:29:30 AM =DT
To: "=

Subject: Invoices

<=blockquote=

Thanks=again Larry

Sent from Windows Mail
=div=>

=/blockquote=

=blockquote type="cite">

=/div>

=blockquote type="cite">

©=A0 please note

The information contained i= this communication is

confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may

constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use =f the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclos=re or copying of this

communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication =n error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to =a href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com"
target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and

destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
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inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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