
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, August 10, 2015 8:32 PM 
To: bellaklein 
Subject: Re: 

yes we pay all 

On Mon, Aug 10, 2015 at 4:06 PM, bellaklein wrote: 

Je=frey, 
submitted his dental bill with estimated total amount $20,000 af=er insurance reimbursement. Deposit of 

$5,000 is required for his next vis=t, and next progress payment is within 6 to 8 weeks. Dental quote attached= Please 
advise. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 212.9=1-1307 <tel:212-971-1307> 

ple=se note 

The information contained in this communication is conf=dential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside infor=ation, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the pro=erty of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this commu=ication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.=lf you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us imme=iately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@g=ail.com> , and destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyrig=t -all rights reserved 
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