
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Sunday, August 2, 2015 2:39 PM 
To: Brice Gordon; Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: ZDC century link lines 

pay it, and then we will talk during the week 

On Sun, Aug 2, 2015 =t 10:37 AM, Brice Gordon wrote: 

Jeffrey 

can we discuss please before you leave today Rich has issue with paying these g=ys who really stepped up to plate and 
got the phone systems sorted out. 
They are not vend=rs, they are retired Century Link pers, total cost for $4160.00 Cash, for =wo peers, this includes labor 
and material thank you Brice Forwarded conversation</=pan> 
Subject: ZDC century link lines<=r> 

Date: Tue, Jul 21, 2015=at 7:01 AM 
To: HBRK Rich Kahn 
Cc: 

FYI 
As of Friday last week we lost all century link lines Alarm, lodge, log cabin gates office LV Believe water has penetrated 
an old splice I have managed to contact a retired century techs and they are working on r=pairs This will be a cash deal 

Sent from my iPhone 

From: Br=ce Gordo 
Date: Thu, Jul 30, 2=15 at 9:19 AM 
To: HBRK Rich Kah 
Cc: Zorro Ran=h 

Att=ched photos for your reference 

Basic Armageddon happen on the phone system Lightening strike RC W=ter in Two splices One seriously pissed =ff 
rodent chew 25 pair at lodge 

=tatus 
The repai= to the copper centurylink lines completed All lines at RC and LV house are fixedq=pan> Fire alarm=line main 
house, fixed Lodge and log cabin fixed 
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One 10 ft 50 p=ir splice 
Can we proceed with paying in cash, <=span> 

Brice 

Brice Gordon 
Stanley, NM 

From: Zorro Ranc 
Date: Thu, Jul 30, 
To= HBRK Rich Kah 
Cc: Zorro Ranch 

=div dir="ltr"> 
I would like to pay these guys as they really s=epped up to plate on this one 

Rich 
Attached photos for your refere=ce 

=/div> 
Basic Armagedd=n happen on the phone system Lightening =trike RC Water in Two splices One seriously pissed off 
rodent chew 25 pair at lod=e 

Status 
The repair to the copper centurylink li=es completed All lines at RC and LV house are fixed Fire alarm line main house, 
fixed=br style="font-size:13px">Lodge and log c=bin fixed 

=span style="font-size:13px">One 10 ft 50 pair splice One 10 ft 25 pair splice 
250 ft of ne= cable for lodge and lodge 
cabin plus other misc material were used cost $560 
2 guys for 5 =ays, 8 plus hours per day 
Total cost for material and labor $4160.00 Please note the follo=ing, we have completely separated the main house 
phone system from lodge a=d log cabin Due to time restraints I elected to use the century link JEE emergency =ine and 
the secondary fire alarm line to get though the visit We will need to sort =his out later, after the visit 

As explained this was a=cash deal 

Date: Thu, Jul30, 2015 at 2:13 PM 
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To: Richard Kahn 

Sent fro= my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Brice Gordon 
Date: J=ly 30, 2015 at 9:19:02 AM MDT 
To: HBRK Rich KahrillOMPIIIIMMORIIIIIIMIIIIIPM 
Cc: Zorro Ranc 
Subject: =e: ZDC century link lines 

From: Zorro Ranch 
=ate: Thu, Jul 30, 2015 at 2:11 PM 
To: HBRK Rich Kahn 

Sent from=my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Brice Gordon 
Date: Ju=y 30, 2015 at 9:19:02 AM MDT 
To: HBRK Rich Kah 
Cc: Zorro Ranc 
Subject: R=: ZDC century link lines 
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<=div> 

From: Zorro Ranch 
Date: Thu, Jul 30, 2015 at 3:36 PM 
To: Ri=hard Kahn 

Sorry this started with the wrong e mail 
My mistake=C2 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Zorro Ranch 
Da • • 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: ZDC century link linesc/=> 

=/blockquote> 

From:=Richard Kahn 
Date= Fri, Jul 31, 2015 at 8:43 AM 
To: 
Cc: 
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No w=uld like to review with you in detail as I was unaware of entire situation=which happened 
over 10 days ago. Paying 4000 cash to vendors is not accept=ble and should be discussed over the phone not sent over 
email. 

<=r>Sent from my i Phone 

=span> 

<Main =ouse 50 Splice.JPG> 

<Old Splice Lodge.JPG> 
<=lockquote type="cite"> 
<Lodge 25 pair.JPG> 
<=div> 

=rom: Zorro Ranc 
Date: Fri,=Jul 31, 21.11.1 
To: Richard Kahn 

Sent from my iPh=ne 

From= Zorro Ranch 
Date: Fri, Jul=31, 2015 at 8:54 AM 
To: Richard Kahn 

So you would prefer to pay Amtel =ates to do this work 
I had no choice 
I will spea= with Jeffrey directly about this 
Thx for your support =AO 
And who the ccd per on this 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 31, 2015, at 8:43 AM, =ichard Kahn 
> wrote: 

<=ont color="#888888"> 
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Brice Gordon 

please =ote 

The information contained in this communication is 
confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside informati=n, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the propert= of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If =ou have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com> , and 
destroy this comm=nication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -=11 rights reserved 
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